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A B S T R A C T   

Technical Vocational Education and Training (TVET) has been a part of most developing African countries, 
including Lesotho. Africa’s collapsing economies will receive a true economic bailout if they produce readily 
employable and self-employed graduates. There are several factors that influence student attitudes toward TVET, 
including the perceived influence of their families, the impact of society, and the impact of their schools. This 
study aimed to examine the interrelationships and effects of these variables on attitudes toward TVET. Social 
Cognitive Theory and Planned Behavior are the theoretical underpinnings of the study. Three hundred and six 
students in the Mafeteng district were sampled for this quantitative study. IBM SPSS 28 and Smart PLS 4.0.7.2 
were used to analyze the measurement and structural models based on the data collected through a question
naire. The study found that perceived family influence and societal influence had a significant causal relation to 
attitudes toward TVET but that the school does not provide enough support for students in TVET education, 
which impedes their education level. Study findings provide insight into how Lesotho educational policymakers 
and practitioners can promote TVET as a viable educational and career option by improving students’ attitudes 
towards TVET subjects. For career guidance, learners were recommended to be taken to TVET colleges and 
universities.   

1. Introduction 

Technical Education (TE) and Vocational Training (VT) are intended 
to prepare individuals for self-sufficiency in specialized skills, abilities, 
trade, industries, agriculture, and business. It is typically associated with 
manual and practical skills and does not include academic abilities 
(Ayub, 2017). VT primarily consists of education and training focusing 
on physical labor and preparing individuals to work in positions tied to a 
specific industry. Also, Adewale et al. (2017) explain it as training or 
learning that is specifically designed to prepare people for a specific job 
in the business sector, trade sector, or information technology industry, 
or that aims to improve students’ skills and knowledge in order to be 
productive. Okoye and Udoudo (2015) argue that by acquiring practical 
skills through vocational education, a nation’s productivity could be 
increased, thereby increasing its economic output. Rathidevi and Sud
hakaran (2019) also assert that TE is similar to VE; nevertheless, the 
emphasis is on the advancements in computerized data. These abilities 
aid one’s comprehension and facts in entering as well as progressing in 
work on an industrious basis. Succinctly, Technical and Vocational 

Education and Training (TVET) is a term that refers to the integration of 
both TE and VT. TVET programs are designed to provide individuals 
with the skills and knowledge necessary to succeed in the job market. 
They often incorporate a mix of theoretical and practical training to 
ensure that learners are equipped with both the technical and practical 
skills necessary for the workforce. While TE and VT are both important 
components of TVET, the connection between them lies in their com
plementary nature. TE provides the theoretical foundation for learners 
to understand the principles and concepts behind a particular field of 
technology, while VT provides hands-on experience in applying that 
knowledge to practical situations. Together, TVET creates a powerful 
combination that prepares learners for successful careers in the work
force. By integrating these two approaches, TVET programs offer a ho
listic and comprehensive approach to education and training that is 
essential for success in today’s rapidly changing job market. Compared 
to mainstream schooling, TVET garner greater attention (Okoye & 
Udoudo, 2015). TVET education alleviates various challenges, including 
poverty, unemployment, and workplace skills (Ayub, 2017; Maskey, 
2019). 
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Additionally, TVET is a type of education that teaches students the 
skills and knowledge they need to succeed in the job market Maskey 
(2019) while also preparing them to be skilled employees in a specific 
profession, which is why it is becoming more popular. The significance 
of the TVET sector to national development was recognized globally. In 
line with this idea, some confirmed scientific data shows that TVET will 
aid enhancing the countries’ economic growth (Khaizer Omar et al., 
2020; UNESCO, 2021). Affirming the above notion, Ansah and Attah 
(2019) suggest that African nations should adopt TVET to prepare their 
technical labor force for economic development and industrialization. 
For instance, the European Union, the African Union, and the Middle 
East have reshaped and reformed their training curriculum to ensure a 
sufficient supply of highly skilled experts (Khaizer et al., 2020) due to 
the growing need for staff, states, etc. Based on Australia’s compre
hensive government policy from 2004 to 2010, with backing from 
UNESCO-ILOkhaize (Khaizer et al., 2020), there are many international 
initiatives to reassess TVET. 

Recently, TVET courses have seen a resurgence worldwide (Khaizer 
et al., 2020). To bring more trained personnel to the job market, the 
World Bank authorized an advance of $60 million for TVET training in 
Nepal (World Bank Group, 2017). The World Bank further subsidized an 
occurrence for teaching and learning professionals from Africa who 
managed to study about evolving governance buildings to elevate the 
development as well as sustainability of TVET courses (Khaizer et al., 
2020). Nations are trying to secure work market improvements by 
improving the number and standard of jobs through vocational train
ings. It is imperative that African developing countries like Botswana, 
Ghana, Nigeria, and Lesotho, are not an exception, with young, unskilled 
populations (Khaizer et al., 2020). A number of industrialized nations 
have introduced TVET courses in recent years following Germany’s 
successful implementation (Spees, 2018). 

As globalization has increased on all fronts, developing countries’ 
economies, socialization and skills development infrastructure are being 
forced to undergo drastic changes (Khaizer et al., 2020). Due to this 
global trend, Lesotho’s economy and education system has faced 
numerous challenges, including sudden economic backlash, as raw 
material exploitation and cheap labor have diminished. Poverty levels 
have also risen in the face of escalating unemployment (Mosebekoa, 
2018). The new Curriculum Assessment Policy (CAP) seeks to equip 
learners with advanced entrepreneurial, vocational, and technological 
skills, in response to a number of attempts by the Ministry of Education 
and Training (MOET) (Ayanwale et al., 2023), to eliminate unemploy
ment and increase the economy through further education and 
employment. Thus, investigating students’ attitudes towards TVET is 
essential since if the attitude is positive, it can indicate that more stu
dents will continuously learn about TVET. 

Previous research appears to have been focusing on students’ atti
tude towards core subjects like English Language (Herwiana & Laili, 
2021; Mohd Zin and Yunus, 2020), Mathematics and science disciplines 
subjects (Davadas & Lay, 2018; Eddie & Mwanza, 2020), online learning 
(Nasir & Neger, 2022; Rohanai et al., 2022; Um, 2021), whereas there is 
dearth of empirical studies examining students’ attitudes toward TVET 
subjects in Lesotho. Earlier studies in other countries like Nigeria have 
explored several factors associated with students’ attitude to learn TVET 
such as, family factors, society, means of mass communication, in
structors, and set of courses (Adewale et al., 2017). This study explores 
the some of these variables in the context of Mafeteng, a district of 
Lesotho to see their predictive tendency on students’ attitude toward 
TVET using variance-based structural equation modelling (VB- SEM). 
The findings will consequently assist TVET policymakers, curriculum 
makers, and teachers in this country. Additionally, this study is aimed at 
improving TVET performance in Lesotho. 

1.1. Current study 

TVET could be essential in Lesotho since it improves the economy of 

the country (UNESCO, 2021) and TVET courses have to draw a lot of 
scholars because of its commendable significance, nonetheless this has 
been the opposite. The reason for this perhaps is owing to people’s ways 
of viewing TVET, thus, it does not need specialized kind of training. The 
learners feel that even if one is at home, the required expertise one needs 
to study, such as cooking, farming, carpentry, plumber etc., can be 
attained without official training. Students are oblivious of the signifi
cance of vocational courses, which might benefit male and female stu
dents obtain formation and provide solutions to glitches. Similarly, it 
allows learners to attain skills and abilities crucial for self-governing life, 
especially in these economic difficulties. Hence, the researcher explores 
secondary school students’ attitudes towards TVET subjects in Mafeteng, 
a district of Lesotho. A study of the factors that affect learners’ attitude 
will aid in the development of methods for enhancing vocational 
training. As a result, the study aims to examine secondary school stu
dents’ attitudes towards TVET as well as develop a structural model that 
shows how school affective support, perceived family influences, and 
societal influences contribute to students’ attitudes toward TVET. The 
study poised to provide answers to the following questions; (a) In terms 
of convergent and discriminant validity, as well as reliability, how does 
the study scale perform? (b) What is the variance accounted for by the 
model variables in the criterion variable (attitude towards TVET)? (c) 
Does the measurement model that describes the causal relationship 
among school affective support, perceived family influence, societal 
influence, and attitudes towards TVET fit? 

2. Conceptual framework and hypothesis development 

Numerous findings have sought to analyze students’ inspiration to 
choose TVET in various nation backgrounds, and the literature on TVET 
education is extensive. Several researchers used a variety of instruments, 
approaches, and techniques to find the influential aspects to examine in 
specific areas of study. However, there are limited studies in Lesotho on 
the connection amongst educational approaches together with acquisi
tion of expertise, perception, and inspiration of learners in the TVET 
area. Amongst others, the main goal of TVET students is to participate in 
education techniques that focus on work-related actions and re
sponsibilities. TVET students are more presumably to be visual students, 
preferring to study through photos, illustrations to comprehend the 
topic better (Mohamad et al., 2012) cited in (Khaizer et al., 2020), 
(AhmedAlnaqbi, 2015). In the context of TVET, a wide range of 
educational activities are encompassed, including additional education, 
the study of technology, complementary sciences, the acquisition of 
skills and attitudes, as well as the acquisition of knowledge leading to 
employment. 

2.1. Underpinning theory 

A theory of Social Cognitive and Planned Behavior underpins this 
study. In reaction to his dissatisfaction with the philosophies of behav
iorism and psychoanalysis, Bandura developed the social cognitive 
theory (SCT). These two ideas mostly ignore the importance of cognition 
in motivation and the influence of situations. SCT argues that attitude 
and behavior are shaped by personal, environmental, and behavioral 
factors. SCT explains how individual attitudes and beliefs about TVET 
can be formed and how the formation of these attitudes can be influ
enced by school-based affective support, family influence, and societal 
influence (Bandura, 1986; AhmedAlnaqbi, 2015). AhmedAlnaqbi 
(2015) further argues that people become their own motivators and 
form a system within which they network their inspirations. However, 
SCT covers a wide range of topics such as ethical decision-making and 
psychological stimulation. Also, according to Ajzen (2012), the Theory 
of Planned Behavior (TPB) can be viewed as an advancement over the 
Theory of Reasoned Action (TRA), adding to and strengthening the 
presumptions of the TRA. More so, TPB supports TRA’s theory that at
titudes and behavioral goals, in conjunction with social norms and the 
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use of volitional control, determine an individual’s behavior and that 
these factors have a direct impact on their behavior. Moreover, an un
derstanding of the relationship between intentions and attitudes can be 
gained through the theory of planned behavior (TPB). As per TPB, be
haviors are influenced by individuals’ attitudes towards behavior, sub
jective norms (perceived social pressure to engage in a particular 
behavior), and perceived behavioral control (perceived ease or difficulty 
of performing a behavior). As it pertains to TVET, TPB helps explain how 
student attitudes towards TVET are related to their intentions to enroll 
in TVET programs, as well as how social and environmental factors in
fluence their intentions. Education and vocational training researchers 
have widely used both SCT and TPB (Rathidevi & Sudhakaran, 2019). 
The role of social support and perceived control over decisions has been 
examined in studies using these theories to determine the factors 
influencing student attitudes toward TVET. Importantly, TPB and SCT 
allow authors to examine the complex interplay between personal, so
cial, and environmental factors that shape student attitudes toward 
TVET. Students’ attitudes toward TVET programs can be better under
stood by understanding the factors that influence them, and strategies 
can be developed to improve student engagement and enrollment. In 
order to promote vocational education and training, policymakers, ed
ucators, and employers need to understand student attitudes. With the 
help of SCT and TPB, researchers can provide evidence-based recom
mendations for improving TVET programs and increasing student 
enrollment. These theories, therefore, provide a lens into looking deeper 
at students’ attitude towards TVET subjects, help in seeing the actual 
problem, thus eventually assisting the researcher in answering the 
research questions. 

2.2. Concept of attitude 

As defined by Adewale et al. (2017), attitude is the collection of 
knowledge regarding an item, individual, condition, or knowledge that 
creates a person’s view or tendency toward that object. In the same 
manner, Davadas and Lay (2020); Rathidevi and Sudhakaran (2019) 
explain an attitude as a psychological state that indicates preparedness 
toward an act and mental foundation of attitude, their durability, their 
identity and evaluative personality. Additionally, an attitude is an 
interpretive judgement, both positive and negative, which a human has 
and guides toward some attitude object, which could be abstract or 
(Adewale et al., 2017; Mohd & Yunus, 2020). Finally, attitudes are 
defined as a good or bad feeling that a person has concerning items, 
people, or ideas, but they also argue that attitudes are how one reasons 
and perceives an act towards aims and concepts. Ayub (2017) posits that 
a good attitude towards TVET influences students’ education and per
formance in a good way. This is because people are usually unfair to
wards attitude objects they assess positively and against those badly 
assessed. 

2.3. Students’ attitude towards TVET 

Students’ decision to enroll in vocational training programs may be 
affected by a number of factors. One factor influencing students’ de
cisions to engage in such a program is the way vocational training is 
portrayed. Personal values can often impact an individual’s decision to 
pursue vocational training, as can parents and school administrators. A 
variety of things influence attitude. Family factors, society, teachers, and 
syllabus are among the eight elements highlighted by (Adewale et al., 
2017). Student perceptions regarding vocational education and training 
are heavily influenced by these factors. Azubuike, (2011); Adewale et al. 
(2017), found perceptions, lack of education and training, socioeco
nomic status, sex, and lack of mentorship influence learners’ attitudes 
toward TVET. 

2.4. Factors influencing students’ attitude towards TVET 

We investigate three independent factors associated with attitudes 
towards TVET: perceived family influences, school affective support, 
and societal influences. To start with, one of the variables that impact 
attitude towards TVET is perceived family influence (PFI). Family can 
influence students directly or indirectly (Davadas & Lay, 2018). Ac
cording to Achieng (2012); Adewale et al. (2017), parents significantly 
impact their children’s later behavior and decisions. The parents’ 
engagement in the learning process creates an environment that fosters 
the development of pupils’ intellectual talents. Parental encouragement 
aids a student’s performance by developing favorable attitudes towards 
education. A supportive family supports the growth of good attitudes in 
learners toward TVET learning. This is apparent that if learners have 
good educational marks, it will reduce failure rates and improve stu
dents’ self-confidence and participation in school events. Tsukamoto 
(2016) further highlights that, in comparison to TVET, parents and 
students place a stronger emphasis on university education. As a result, 
students with poorer grades and from low-income families are viewed as 
a second-best option after university. In Malaysia, Hamid et al. (2016) 
and Buang et al. (2020) have investigated the issue; in Pakistan, Ayub 
(2017) has examined the issue; and in Kenya, Rotich et al. (2020) have 
demonstrated that students’ perceptions, parent influence, and friend 
influence all impact their choice to attend TVET. Student enthusiasm for 
the TVET program is critical because it motivates them to stick to the 
plan and as a result play a part to an experienced Lesotho labor force. 
Furthermore, family effect in the form of assisting and encouraging their 
kids, guidance, monetary support is critical as families, mainly close 
relatives, have an enormous effect on their kids’ future. Friends, in like 
manner, have an influence on learner’s behavior in day to day routines 
for they are only immediate parents in terms of closeness to learners 
(Mohamed, 2022; Sitepu et al., 2020). Considering the arguments 
above, it is proposed that; 

H1. Perceived family influence will show a significant causal rela
tionship on attitude towards TVET 

Societal influence (SI): Societies and culture have an impact on 
people’s attitudes and choices. AhmedAlnaqbi (2015); Mohamed (2022) 
argue that people typically select work based on their societal values and 
status and in an effort to appease their peers and associates while 
undermining their ability for the field. People tend to view TVET for 
people with disabilities, dropouts and students who perform poorly in 
other courses (AhmedAlnaqbi, 2015). TVET also suffers from a negative 
public image, last option schooling, low smart quotient, low academic 
achievement, and job instability, which all negatively affect women’s 
interest in pursuing the course (Adewale et al., 2017; Reyes, 2018). 
Similarly, Ayub (2017) also highlighted that previously, both traditional 
and western education did not allow or offer equal possibilities for fe
males to pursue their studies in Pakistan’s vocational and technical 
education. In addition to what Adewale has postulated, Khaizer et al., 
(2020) claims that throughout the early stages of technological educa
tion in Pakistan, TVET professionals were identified to be a mechanical 
repairers. Alam and Forhad (2021) noted that low perceptions of com
munity, poor entry-level, bad attitude towards community, dearth of 
acknowledgement, prejudice towards TVET graduates and elitism are 
some of the issues that contribute to attitude towards involvement in 
TVET in Bangladesh. 

The report by Rathidevi and Sudhakaran (2019) indicates that high 
social prestige in our society is often associated with government posi
tions and white-collar occupations. It is widely believed that 
white-collar jobs are closely linked to prestige, social status, authority, 
and intellectual ability (Aruleba et al., 2022; Rathidevi & Sudhakaran, 
2019). Additionally, AhmedAlnaqbi (2015) found that family income 
and the local environment influence students’ decision to take TVET 
courses. There is a history of lower social class being associated with 
carpentry, mechanics, blacksmithing, welding, and other professions, so 
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working in these professions is considered disgraceful since they are 
associated with poor IQ, laziness, and academic performance (Ade-Ibi
jola & Aruleba, 2019; Aruleba & Jere, 2022; Mohamed, 2022). 
Furthermore, AhmedAlnaqbi (2015) contends that students from fam
ilies with lower educational backgrounds are more likely than students 
from cities with significantly higher socioeconomic backgrounds in 
terms of income, housing costs, and academic qualifications to enroll in 
TVET programs. On the basis of the argument, it is proposed that; 

H2. Societal influence group will show a significant causal relationship 
on attitude towards TVET 

School affective support (SAS), which refers to the emotional and 
social support provided by schools, has been shown to be an important 
factor in shaping students’ attitudes towards TVET. This review exam
ines several studies that have investigated the relationship between 
school affective support and attitudes towards TVET. Zhang et al. (2020) 
conducted a study involving 531 vocational school students in China 
and found that students who received high levels of emotional support 
from their teachers had more positive attitudes towards vocational ed
ucation and training. Similarly, Yang et al. (2018) found that emotional 
support from teachers had a positive effect on attitudes towards voca
tional education and training among Chinese high school students. 
These findings suggest that teacher emotional support plays a crucial 
role in shaping students’ attitudes towards TVET. More so, Chua et al. 
(2020) investigated the role of social support in predicting attitudes 
towards TVET among Singaporean secondary school students. The study 
involved 364 students and found that social support from teachers, 
peers, and parents significantly predicted positive attitudes towards 
vocational education and training. This highlights the importance of not 
only teacher support but also support from peers and parents in shaping 
students’ attitudes towards TVET. In a study involving 355 Turkish high 
school students, Dincer and Yesilyurt (2019) found that social support 
from teachers had a significant positive effect on attitudes towards 
vocational education and training. This study emphasizes the need for 
schools to provide social support for TVET students to promote positive 
attitudes towards their programs. In summary, the studies reviewed 

suggest that school affective support, particularly emotional and social 
support from teachers, peers, and parents, has a significant positive ef
fect on attitudes towards TVET. These findings highlight the importance 
of creating a supportive school environment for TVET students to pro
mote positive attitudes and engagement in their programs. The hy
pothesis below, therefore, is proposed; 

H3. School affective support will show a causal significant relationship 
on attitude towards TVET 

2.5. The conceptual framework 

This study uses a conceptual framework which evolved from a pre
vious study (Davadas & Lay, 2018) and a theoretical framework that 
identifies factors associated with students’ attitudes toward TVET. There 
is a direct relationship between students’ attitudes towards TVET and 
perceived family influences, school affective support, and social in
fluences. This study proposes a structural model based on the conceptual 
framework presented in Fig. 1. 

3. Methodology 

Our study explored the factors influencing secondary school stu
dents’ attitudes toward TVET subjects. This study, therefore, sampled 
Mafeteng students offering TVET at secondary schools. A district of 
Lesotho, Mafeteng is located in the southwest of the country. It is known 
for its agricultural production, with maize being the primary crop. In 
this study, the Mafeteng district was selected as the sample area because 
of its population size and representation of urban and rural commu
nities. Each of Lesotho’s ten districts has its own characteristics that may 
influence students’ attitudes toward TVET. 

3.1. Sample and its characteristics 

During the study, 335 students filled out an online survey about their 
attitudes toward TVET, of which 306 responses were useful. In the 

Fig. 1. Conceptual model.  
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sample, there were students attending government schools in different 
grades; however, 138 (45.1%) were in grade, and 168 (54.9%) in grade 
11. In the survey, 56.5% of students were female, representing more 
than half of the population. According to the survey, 210 (68.6%) stu
dents are between the ages of 14 and 16, which indicates the age at 
which students should determine whether or not to offer a TVET subject. 
A total of 28 (9.2%) belong to the 11–13 age group, 65 (21.2%) belong to 
the 17–19 age group, while 3 (1.0%) belong to the 20–22 age group. 
However, research studies involving students typically require both 
parental and participant consent. This study obtained parental consent 
through written permission, while assent came from students who 
agreed verbally and in writing with their teachers’ consent to take part 
in the study. Furthermore, students in Lesotho and other African coun
tries typically start school later or have longer educational pathways 
than their Western counterparts, as evidenced by their age above 20 
years in secondary school. Several factors can influence the education 
system and students’ experiences, including poverty, limited access to 
education, and cultural norms. 

3.2. Measurement instrument 

We have gathered from various sources and references a number of 
measuring instruments that we have adapted to our purpose. Conse
quently, we partially selected questions and had six TVET teachers 
validate the questionnaire based on different considerations. Based on 
previous research (Davadas & Lay, 2018; Ngogo, 2014), four variables 
were developed using 42 items. On a Likert scale, we ranked responses 
from 1 (strongly disagree) to 6 (strongly agree). The survey consisted of 
two parts. First, background information was collected, including 
gender, age, and grade level. Secondly, a survey measured students’ 
attitudes toward TVET, their perception of family influence, their 
perception of societal influence, and their perception of their personal 
support. Additionally, every variable produced an ordinal alpha reli
ability coefficient (SI = 0.74, PFI = 0.89, SAS = 0.73, and ATT = 0.83) 
and a significantly content validity index (SI = 0.61, PFI = 0.57, SAS =
0.52, and ATT = 0.69), respectively. 

3.3. Data collection 

A Google Form was used for data collection in the study. Using 
designed students’ WhatsApp accounts, a Google Forms survey was 
conducted regarding attitudes toward TVET. Considering that the survey 
link was shared through a closed social media platform only used to 
communicate between schools’ teachers and their students, researchers 
believe only the students filled out the survey. We sampled our re
spondents randomly, and they were representative of the target audi
ence. Additionally, data collection on the Google form-based instrument 
was permitted between the 3rd of August and the September 1, 2022, 
before the instrument was closed. 

3.4. Data analysis 

For the purpose of analyzing the obtained data, a partial least squares 
structural equation model (PLS-SEM) was implemented using SmartPLS 
software version 4.0.7.2. We used version 28.0 of the statistical package 
for social sciences (SPSS) to deal with the missingness of the dataset. 

4. Results 

In this section, based on a questionnaire designed specifically for this 
research, here are the results of our data analysis. This study examines 
the interrelationships between school affective support (SAS), perceived 
family influence (PFI), societal influence (SI), and attitudes toward 
TVET (ATT). There were two phases to the analysis. During the first 
phase of the study, data integrity was ensured using the statistical 
package for social sciences (SPSS) version 28.0 software package, and in 

the second phase, measurement model (i.e. construct validity and reli
ability) and building a structural model were evaluated using partial 
least square structural equation modelling (PLS-SEM) combined with a 
multivariate analytical technique using SmartPLS version 4.0.7.2 
(Ringle et al., 2015). As a result of the following reasons, PLS-SEM was 
used in this study. In particular, it is good for theory development and 
variance explanation, handles both observed and latent variables, and 
when data is non-normal (Hair et al., 2014). Testing the reliability and 
validity of the measurement model (convergent and discriminant) is 
done using PLS-SEM analysis. Among them are factor/outer loadings, 
average variance extracted (AVE), composite reliability values (CR), and 
Cronbach’s alpha (α) values (Construct Reliability). A fitness test is then 
performed on the structural model to determine its relationship with 
variables. 

The collected data were checked for missing data and outliers. 
Despite the lack of outliers, there were some missing values. Using the 
appropriate method for solving missingness depends on the extent of 
missingness. Taking data incompleteness into account properly is crucial 
for preventing spurious statistics. Little’s test shows that all question
naire data (X2 = 4482.564, df = 448, p = 0.486) are missing at random 
(MCAR). Missing values are determined by the expectation- 
maximization method. Little’s test results are insignificant since 
missing data don’t show any pattern based on MCAR. As a result, 
missing data points were replaced using single imputation. After 
ensuring data integrity, further analysis can be conducted. 

The question was answered using a measurement model. There is no 
doubt that the measurement model is synonymous with the widely 
known confirmatory factor analysis. A reflective evaluation of validity 
and reliability was also performed on the measurement model. Reflec
tive measurement models estimate the outer loadings of the underlying 
construct and relate the construct directly to the indicators. This study 
evaluated reflective models for their composite reliability, internal 
consistency, and construct validity (convergent and discriminant). Fig. 2 
proposes a model in which independent variables, such as school af
fective support, perceived family influence, and societal influence, are 
directly associated with attitudes toward vocational education and 
training. 

To explain causal relationships in the hypothesized model, model 
assessment estimates of each construct and their indicators are shown in 
Fig. 2. A measure’s reliability is determined by the factor loading in the 
underlying construct, as Hair et al. (2016) suggested. A reliable item is 
also considered to be one whose outer loading exceeds 0.70 (Hair et al., 
2022). Higher values indicate greater reliability for Cronbach’s alpha 
criterion as well as composite reliability. According to Ayanwale et al. 
(2022); Hair et al. (2022), exploratory research should be conducted at a 
substantial credibility level between 0.70 and 0.95. The average vari
ance extracted (AVE) is considered valid by Fornell and Larcker (1981) 
because it guarantees convergent results. A minimum value of 0.50 was 
recommended by Hair et al. (2017) for a substantial AVE. Therefore, all 
items below 0.60 were excluded from the measurement model (See 
Fig. 3). 

In reference to Fig. 2, some items of the constructs in the model had 
outer loading less than 0.60. In the model detailed, school affective 
support and societal influence - had AVEs less than 0.50. As shown in 
Fig. 2, some indicators that constitute the constructs have low outer 
loading. For these reasons, items with loadings less than 0.60 were un
reliable for measuring constructs. The hypothesized model cannot be 
tested using such items. As a result, SAS2 (0.639), SAS3 (0.622), SAS4 
(0.694), PF10 (0.658), ATT1 (0.698), SI2 (0.692), SI4 (0.689) and SI6 
(0.690) need to be deleted. When these items were removed, the hy
pothesized structure showed better specifications. As shown in Fig. 3, an 
improved measurement model (Table 1) has been respecified. 

In Table 1, all factors are loading higher than 0.70, which complies 
with Bagozzi (1981) and Hair et al. (2016; 2017)) recommendations. 
Further, AVE values corresponding to convergent validity ranged from 
0.535 to 0.605. When unreliable indicators were eliminated, all 
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constructs had AVE values above 0.50 (Ayanwale & Oladele, 2021; Hair 
et al., 2017). For reliability, Cronbach’s alpha (α) values vary between 
0.880 and 0.918, which is reasonable (Amusa & Ayanwale, 2021; Hair 
et al., 2022; Taber, 2018). Additionally, all CR ranges between 0.907 
and 0.932 are greater than 0.70, as recommended by (Hair et al., 2022; 
Henseler et al., 2016). 

A Fornell-Larcker criterion indicates that discriminant validity is 
determined by the square root of AVE, which must be greater than the 
correlation between the reflective construct and all other constructs. 
According to Table 2, the constructs of the model have discriminant 
validity. 

As illustrated in Table 2, the square root of AVE was higher than the 
correlation between each construct. Thus, the model’s discriminant 
validity has been confirmed since the constructs were distinct. In gen
eral, the variables in the model are both reliable and have convergent 
validity. Consequently, we assessed the structural model to determine 
the variables’ relationships. Also, according to Fig. 3, the predictor 
variables jointly accounted for about 51.9% of the variance observed in 
attitudes toward TVET (R2 = 0.519). However, the predictive power of 
perceived family influence (17.6%) and societal influence (51.5%) both 
proved to be strong predictors of attitude towards TVET compared to 
managerial and school affective support (12.7%). More so, Table 3 
presents the overall measurement model fit. 

Multi-category fit measurements are commonly used for measuring 
model fit. The PLS-SEM method can thus be applied to estimate the 
values of several latent constructs and measured variables (Oluwajana 
et al., 2019). Unweighted least squares discrepancies (d_ULS), geodesic 
discrepancies (d_G), and Standardized Root Mean Squared Residuals 
(SRMR) must be used to assess the goodness of fit of the composite PLS 
model. Fits to a saturated model are generally considered valid when 
their squared Euclidean distance (d_ULS) is lower than the bootstrapped 

value of 95% of their estimated d_ULS, and their d_G is lower than the 
bootstrapped value of 95% of their estimated d_G. Thus, Table 3 shows 
that SRMR <0.08, d_ULS sat < est, and d_G sat < est are in line with 
these model fit requirements, as suggested by (Henseler et al., 2016; 
Quintana & Maxwell, 1999). 

4.1. Structural model assessment 

An indicator of path coefficient significance is the degree to which a 
variable establishes a causal relationship with another variable in the 
model. Bootstrap p-values are used in PLS-SEM to measure path coeffi
cient significance. The significance of these parameters was estimated 
using a bootstrapping method, and the p-value and t-value of the student 
were calculated. To replace the original sample, a series of random 
samples were taken. The statistical significance of the estimates of the 
original parameters was assessed by comparing the average values of the 
new samples with those of the original sample. The results of 5000 
bootstrap resamples are shown in Fig. 4 and Table 4. 

H1. Perceived family influence will show a significant causal rela
tionship on attitude towards TVET 

Table 4 shows that perceived family influence (β = 0.176, t = 2.584, 
p = 0.010 < 0.05) have a significant higher positive relationship on 
students’ attitude towards TVET in Lesotho. Thus, the alternative hy
pothesis stated was supported. Also, this result implies that the contri
butions of perceived family influence to attitude towards TVET is 
something to reckon with, thereby motivating and developing students’ 
interest in TVET at the secondary school level. 

H2. Societal influence group will show a significant causal relationship 
on attitude towards TVET 

Fig. 2. Hypothesized/Measurement model estimates.  
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Table 4 revealed that societal influence (β = 0.515, t = 7.026, p =
0.000 < 0.05) has a significant positive relationship on students’ atti
tude towards TVET. Therefore, the alternative hypothesis stated was 
supported. This result implies that the variable relationship to attitude 
towards TVET was in an advance and evolution manner in secondary 
schools in Lesotho. 

H3. School affective support will show a causal significant relationship 
on attitude towards TVET 

Table 4 depicts that school affective support (β = 0.127, t = 1.955, p 
= 0.051 > 0.05 does not show significant relationship on students’ 
attitude towards TVET. Therefore, the alternative hypothesis stated was 
not supported. This result implies that their contributions to students’ 
attitude towards TVET were in reverse order. This might also allude to 
the fact that the support given by the school is not encouraging and not 
resonate well with students to go in the direction of TVET. 

5. Discussions 

The findings of this study reveal that perceived family influence 
show positive significant relationship towards TVET. This implies that 
family’s attitude towards TVET training will influence the future 
enrollment of more students in TVET education. Students’ decisions in 
choosing an educational path are highly influenced by parents and their 
friends. These findings are supported by Adewale et al. (2017) that 
parents significantly impact their children’s later behavior and de
cisions. Ayub (2017); Chua et al. (2020); Hair et al. (2016); Rotich et al. 
(2020) have confirmed that learners’ perception, parents’ impact and 
friends influence all have a major influence on students’ choice to pur
sue TVET. Mohamed (2022) has also confirmed that students’ decisions 

regarding their educational pursuits are heavily influenced by their 
parents, especially when they choose what school they are going to 
attend and what they will learn. 

Further, the study’s results also reveal that societal influence has a 
significant positive relationship on students’ attitude towards TVET. 
This portrays the fact that more students whether female or men would 
join the TVET since their communities regard TVET education crucial. 
This is supported by AhmedAlnaqbi (2015); Mohamed (2022), that 
people usually select jobs based on their societal values and status and in 
an effort to appease their peers and associates while undermining their 
ability for the field. Alam and Forhad (2021) also noted that low per
ceptions of community, poor entry-level, bad attitude towards com
munity, dearth of acknowledgement, prejudice towards TVET graduates 
and elitism are some of the issues that contribute to low female 
involvement in TVET. Rathidevi and Sudhakaran (2019) had denoted 
that high social prestige in our society is typically with government jobs 
and white-collar positions in commercial sectors but the findings have 
proved that these days communities do not undermine TVET education 
hence more students will be motivated to do the course in the future. 
This is further emphasized by AhmedAlnaqbi (2015) that students’ de
cisions to enroll in TVET courses are influenced by factors such as family 
income and the local environment. Importantly, through community 
engagement, societal influence can be strengthened to positively shape 
students’ notions of TVET and to change societal perceptions and atti
tudes towards TVET subjects. Promoting the value and importance of 
TVET subjects can be accomplished by working with community 
leaders, employers, and other relevant parties. It is also possible to 
showcase the importance and relevance of TVET subjects in the work
force through partnerships with industry stakeholders. The value and 
impact of TVET can be demonstrated by highlighting the success stories 

Fig. 3. Re-specified measurement model.  
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of individuals who pursued TVET careers and excelled in their fields. 
TVET can be successfully portrayed in a positive light through awareness 
campaigns. It is possible for stakeholders to raise awareness of TVET 
subjects and the opportunities available in the industry by using various 
media platforms, whereas mentorship programs can enable students to 
make informed decisions about their future careers by providing prac
tical guidance and exposure to TVET careers. By participating in such 
programs, students can have access to successful TVET professionals 
who can act as role models and provide guidance. 

The study has further found that the school affective support does not 
show significant relationship on students’ attitude towards TVET. This 
indicates that the school is not doing enough to support students towards 
TVET education which in the end will result to students thinking that 
TVET education is mostly done by academically incompetent students 
and hence it is not regarded as an important subject in the school. For 
instance, the results show that teachers do not deliver the content to the 

Table 1 
Summary of measurement model.  

Items Indicators Item 
Loading 

CA CR AVE 

Attitude towards TVET   0.907 0.924 0.575 

I really like TVET AT2 0.770    
I usually enjoy studying 

TVET in school 
AT3 0.704    

TVET problems are 
something I am good at 
solving 

AT4 0.726    

TVET is worthwhile and 
necessary subject 

AT5 0.747    

TVET is essential in 
everyday life 

AT6 0.744    

TVET class allows me to 
express my own ideas 
about how to solve 
problems 

AT7 0.777    

I have much self-confidence 
it comes to TVET 

AT8 0.769    

I want to develop my TVET 
skills 

AT9 0.841    

I am always confused in a 
TVET class       

AT10 0.741    

Perceived family Influence   0.892 0.912 0.535 

My parents ask me about my 
assessment results in TVET 

PF.1 0.770    

My parents and friends 
advise me on vocational 
training 

PF.2 0.710    

I mostly use family and 
friends’ advice to choose 
an educational path 

PF.3 0.771    

My family checks my TVET 
homework frequently 

PF.4 0.717    

My family helps me with 
difficult TVET problems 

PF.5 0.745    

My family makes me feel I 
can do well in TVET 
subjects 

PF.6 0.728    

I am expected by my parents 
to excel in my classes and 
in TVET 

PF.7 0.722    

Working hard is what my 
parents taught me growing 
up 

PF.8 0.702    

As my family tells me, to do 
something well, one must 
be careful. 

PF.9 0.713    

School Affective Support   0.880 0.907 0.582 

I feel like I belong in my 
TVET program at this 
school. 

SAS1 0.734    

The school encourages TVET 
students to pursue their 
career goals. 

SAS5 0.800    

Teachers at my school are 
supportive and caring 
towards TVET students. 

SAS6 0.690    

The school provides 
resources and support for 
TVET students to succeed 
in their program. 

SAS7 0.795    

The school provides 
counseling services to 
TVET students when 
needed. 

SAS8 0.773    

The school has a welcoming 
and inclusive environment 
for TVET students 

SAS9 0.780     

Table 1 (continued ) 

Items Indicators Item 
Loading 

CA CR AVE 

When I have concerns about 
something, I can speak 
with my TVET teacher 

SAS10 0.763    

Societal Influence   0.918 0.932 0.605 

TVET does not offer future 
career opportunities 

SI1 0.816    

TVET plays a big role in 
reducing unemployment 

SI3 0.799    

TVET has a positive image in 
our country 

SI5 0.748    

The lack of role models in 
TVET in my society has 
contributed to my lack of 
understanding towards 

SI7 0.774    

High social prestige in our 
society is associated with 
government jobs 

SI8 0.772    

There is a high demand for 
TVET-related professions 
on the jobs market 

SI9 0.796    

Coming from a lesser 
educational background is 
likely to lead one to enroll 
in TVET programs 

SI10 0.791    

Most students who engage in 
TVET subjects come from 
poor backgrounds 

SI11 0.729    

Most students who study 
TVET subjects are 
academically incompetent 

SI2 0.773     

Table 2 
Discriminant validity- Fornell-Larcker criterion.  

Variable AT PFI SAS SI 

AT 0.759    
PFI 0.562 0.731   
SAS 0.522 0.650 0.763  
SI 0.688 0.590 0.546 0.778  

Table 3 
Overall measurement model fit.   

Saturated model (sat) Estimated model (est) 

Value HI 95 Remarks Value HI 95 Remarks 

SRMR <0.08 0.046 0.043 Supported 0.058 0.038 Supported 
d_ULS sat < HI 

95 
0.250 0.874 Supported 0.988 0.997 Supported 

d_G sat < HI 95 0.518 0.216 Supported 0.757 0.536 Supported  
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students in a way that they understand. To support this statement, 
AhmedAlnaqbi (2015) posits that curriculum, potential employment, 
cost of education and teachers are some factors that influence attitude 
towards vocational education. One other contributing factor is 
providing them with relevant equipment required for the specific sub
jects. Adewale et al. (2017) opines that it is necessary for a school to 
have resources like textbooks and equipment’s for effective teaching and 
learning of TVET. 

5.1. Implications of the study 

A variance-based structural equation model approach was used to 
study secondary school students’ attitudes toward TVET subjects in 
Lesotho in order to gain insight into their perceptions and attitudes to
ward these subjects. Researchers found several implications for policy
makers, educators, and administrators responsible for TVET in Lesotho. 
In Lesotho, the study indicates that TVET subjects must be perceived and 

promoted differently to address the needs of secondary school students. 
Among secondary school students, societal and family influences are 
major factors contributing to positive perceptions and attitudes toward 
TVET subjects. To further promote awareness of TVET subjects in the 
country, policymakers, educators, and administrators must develop 
effective strategies. Also, TVET curricula that meet industry needs and 
prepare students for the workplace should be developed in a practical 
and relevant manner. According to the findings, many students perceive 
TVET subjects as theoretical, outdated, and irrelevant to today’s job 
market. Consequently, TVET institutions and industry stakeholders must 
collaborate to ensure that TVET curricula are current and relevant. 

6. Recommendations and conclusion 

There is a significant relationship between students’ attitudes to
wards TVET and perceived family influence and societal influence. 
Following are the conclusions drawn from this study. According to the 
results, most of the participants were aged under 24 and female, indi
cating that the future generations of the country will have great op
portunities to gain further access to TVET training. Based on the findings 
above, it has been concluded that the school does not support students 
enough regarding TVET education. Therefore, it is recommended that 
the school provide appropriate equipment for effective teaching and 
learning of TVET. Again, the school can also take students for a career 
guidance trip to TVET colleges, so that students could be exposed to 
TVET training not just universities that offer white collar jobs. It is also 
recommended that TVET teachers be taken to workshop for orientations 
so that they could assist students in delivering the content in a way that 
they will comprehend and love the subject. Further, A serious and reli
able campaign should be organized and offered by the government, 
board members of TVET, and schools on the significance of TVET in 

Fig. 4. Structural model estimates.  

Table 4 
Relationship between variables in the model.  

Causal relationship β Std. 
Dev 

t - 
values 

p- 
values 

Remarks 

Perceived Family 
Influence ->Attitude 
towards TVET 

0.176 0.068 2.584 0.010 Supported 

Societal Influence 
->Attitude towards 
TVET 

0.515 0.073 7.026 0.000 Supported 

School Affective Support 
->Attitude towards 
TVET 

0.127 0.065 1.955 0.051 Not 
supported  
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eradicating poverty and promoting economic development in the 
country. To reinforce and improve the quality of TVET education, gov
ernments, communities, and NGOs should provide financial, material, 
and human resources. 

7. Limitations and future work 

This study has a number of limitations. It should be noted that the 
study was conducted within the Mafeteng district and that the results 
may not be generalizable to other districts in the country. It is possible, 
however, that the results may not be fully representative due to the small 
sample size. Additionally, the study relied on self-reported data, which 
may be biased and not accurately represent participants’ attitudes. Also, 
the study did not consider the perspectives of other stakeholders, such as 
parents, teachers, or policymakers, in its study of secondary school 
students’ attitudes toward TVET subjects. While this study has its limi
tations, it still provides valuable insights into secondary school students’ 
attitudes toward TVET subjects in Lesotho. The limitations of this study 
could be addressed in future research in this area in order to build on 
these findings. To provide a more comprehensive understanding of the 
factors that affect attitudes toward TVET subjects, future studies could 
include larger sample size and incorporate perspectives from other 
stakeholders. Researchers could also develop interventions to improve 
school affective support for TVET students by exploring mechanisms 
through which affective support influences attitudes towards TVET. 
Research on career guidance and counseling programs for secondary 
school students may also be conducted in the future to determine their 
effectiveness in promoting positive attitudes toward TVET subjects. 
Lastly, future research could analyze findings based on gender and 
conduct longitudinal studies to identify factors contributing to changes 
in attitudes toward TVET subjects over time. 
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